
[[126899 WOODS DIRT]] VOLVO A60H 350215 - BOGIE/CENTER AXLE

Sample No: VCP408121
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 90
Job No: 126899 WOODS DIRT

THE GW VAN KEPPEL CO1876 NORTH 105TH EAST AVENUETULSA, OKUS  74116Contact: MIKE DEVOREMDEVORE@VANKEPPEL.COMT: (918)836-8851F: (918)834-1659
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0053Unique No: 10552843Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 14 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0053 [WUSCAR] 05897033 (Generated: 07/14/2023 14:09:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE DEVORE - VOLVO0053

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP408121 --- --- ---Sample Date 10 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2196 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 109 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 139 --- --- ---Copper ppm 0 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 3 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 139 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 18 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 78 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 847 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 58 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0053 [WUSCAR] 05897033 (Generated: 07/14/2023 14:09:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE DEVORE - VOLVO0053
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 350215\Bogie/Center Axle [VCP408121] 10 Jul 2023 @ 2196.0 hrs

