
[[19096]] VOLVO A45G 353355 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP426893
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL WB102
Job No: 19096

GAINES & CO526 THREE SISTERS RDKNIGHTDALE, NCUS  27545Contact: BEAR PERONEgperone@gainesandco.comT: (919)524-4711F: (919)944-0091
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.The ironlevel is abnormal. All other metallevels are typical for a newcomponent breaking in. Elementallevel of silicon (Si) above normalindicating ingress of seal material.The condition of the oil is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: GAIKNIUnique No: 10552876Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 14 Jul 2023
Report Id: GAIKNI [WUSCAR] 05897066 (Generated: 07/14/2023 14:24:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BEAR PERONE - GAIKNI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP426893 VCP425602 --- ---Sample Date 07 Jul 2023 03 Apr 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 946 558 --- ---Oil Hours 946 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.7 41.0 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 31 17 --- ---Sodium ppm 11 13 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 63 17 --- ---Copper ppm 40 12 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm <1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 1 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 3 2 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm <1 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3637 4097 --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 20 --- ---Zinc ppm 1601 1642 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1315 1312 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 128 136 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GAIKNI [WUSCAR] 05897066 (Generated: 07/14/2023 14:24:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BEAR PERONE - GAIKNI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 353355\Wet Disc Brake [VCP426893] 07 Jul 2023 @ 946.0 hrs

