
[ASCENDUM MACHINERY 500HR CSA/TRIANGLE GRADING [19006]] VOLVO EC220E 1877 (S/N 310551) - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP407554
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 19006

TRIANGLE GRADING AND PAVING INC1521 Huffman Mill RdBURLINGTON, NCUS  27216Contact: KAREN HILLIARDkhilliard@trianglegradingpaving.comT: (336)584-1745F: (336)584-0145
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: TRIBURUnique No: 10552880Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 14 Jul 2023
Report Id: TRIBUR [WUSCAR] 05897070 (Generated: 07/14/2023 14:00:33) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP407554 VCP382655 VCP387533 VCP0000499Sample Date 03 Jul 2023 20 Feb 2023 06 Sep 2022 08 Feb 2022Machine Hours 6473 6088 5535 4978Oil Hours 0 0 0 870Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status NORMAL MARGINAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 341 335 338 338
 CONTAMINATIONWater % --- 0.298 --- ---Silicon ppm 26 9 7 6Sodium ppm 2 2 2 0Potassium ppm 2 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 597 543 447 356Copper ppm 25 21 14 6Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 7 <1 2 5Chromium ppm 5 6 4 4Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 <1 1Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 5 5 4 3Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 15 15 22 103Magnesium ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Zinc ppm 78 49 75 88Phosphorus ppm 1041 869 895 1093Barium ppm 0 0 1 0Boron ppm 68 105 130 157

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TRIBUR [WUSCAR] 05897070 (Generated: 07/14/2023 14:00:45) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC220E 1877 (S/N 310551)\Swing Drive [VCP407554] 03 Jul 2023 @ 6473.0 hrs

