
[[18965]] VOLVO A45G 353358 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP410420
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: 18965

GAINES & CO526 THREE SISTERS RDKNIGHTDALE, NCUS  27545Contact: BEAR PERONEgperone@gainesandco.comT: (919)524-4711F: (919)944-0091
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The filter change at thetime of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.Moderate concentrationof visible metal present. Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: GAIKNIUnique No: 10552893Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 14 Jul 2023
Report Id: GAIKNI [WUSCAR] 05897083 (Generated: 07/14/2023 14:07:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BEAR PERONE - GAIKNI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP410420 VCP395557 --- ---Sample Date 29 Jun 2023 21 Feb 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 984 506 --- ---Oil Hours 984 506 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.0 29.1 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 13 14 --- ---Sodium ppm 4 3 --- ---Potassium ppm 4 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 28 22 --- ---Copper ppm 13 10 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 3 1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 16 9 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 2 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 3 3 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 70 86 --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 4 --- ---Zinc ppm 0 10 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 191 194 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 81 80 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GAIKNI [WUSCAR] 05897083 (Generated: 07/14/2023 14:07:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BEAR PERONE - GAIKNI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 353358\Transmission (Auto) [VCP410420] 29 Jun 2023 @ 984.0 hrs

