
KENWORTH FLUSHER TRUCK - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP409003
Oil Type: EXTENDED LIFE COOLANT
Job No:

MARYLAND ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES21210 MARTINSBURG RDDICKERSON, MDUS  20842Contact: ALAN PARRISHaparr@menv.comT: (301)428-8185F: (301)428-8311
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Thecarboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The glycol level isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: MARDICUnique No: 10559609Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 17 Jul 2023
Report Id: MARDIC [WUSCAR] 05898253 (Generated: 07/17/2023 14:17:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ALAN PARRISH - MARDIC

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP409003 VCP364910 VCP338456 ---Sample Date 05 Jul 2023 18 Oct 2022 14 Dec 2021 ---Machine Hours 1224 4305 3359 ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 8.27 8.27 8.25 ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 336 788 0 ---Percentage Glycol % 54.0 53.8 53 ---Freezing Point °C -45 -43 -45 ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal normal normal ---Coolant Color Orange Red Green ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: MARDIC [WUSCAR] 05898253 (Generated: 07/17/2023 14:17:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ALAN PARRISH - MARDIC
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	KENWORTH KENWORTH FLUSHER TRUCK\Coolant [VCP409003] 05 Jul 2023 @ 1224.0 hrs

