
[[SWO-063670]] VOLVO A45G 340126 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP412707
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: SWO-063670

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10559727Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 17 Jul 2023
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05898371 (Generated: 07/18/2023 16:29:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412707 VCP351742 --- ---Sample Date 11 Jul 2023 04 Apr 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 8645 6123 --- ---Oil Hours 0 6123 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status NORMAL ATTENTION --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.9 11.3 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.8 10.4 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 80 79 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.6 0.7 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 62 74 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 63 66 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 0.6 --- ---Silicon ppm 6 7 --- ---Sodium ppm 12 185 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 7 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12 9 --- ---Copper ppm 1 8 --- ---Lead ppm <1 2 --- ---Tin ppm <1 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 6 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 37 42 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1666 1498 --- ---Magnesium ppm 503 645 --- ---Zinc ppm 1086 1129 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 879 1025 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 36 39 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05898371 (Generated: 07/18/2023 16:29:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 340126\Diesel Engine [VCP412707] 11 Jul 2023 @ 8645.0 hrs

