
[[10627 FREEDOM CONSTR]] VOLVO EC160E 314382 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP416345
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: 10627 FREEDOM CONSTR

HOFFMAN EQUIPMENT - LIONVILLE120 GORDON DRIVELIONVILLE, PAUS  19341Contact: JIM FEHRjim.fehr@hoffmanequip.comT: (610)363-9200F: (610)594-0829
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO8879Unique No: 10559744Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 17 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8879 [WUSCAR] 05898388 (Generated: 07/18/2023 02:21:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM FEHR - VOLVO8879

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416345 VCP410763 VCP400495 VCP386458Sample Date 07 Jul 2023 27 Mar 2023 26 Jan 2023 14 Nov 2022Machine Hours 2662 2125 1683 1146Oil Hours 0 500 500 0Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL MARGINAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.3 13.2 12.2 12.7Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 5.7 7.8 9.7 8.0Oxidation (PA) % 47 51 79 66
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 0.1 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 65 64 63 71Sulfation (PA) % 51 50 60 59Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 0.9 <1.0 1.2 <1.0Silicon ppm 11 7 5 7Sodium ppm 2 1 3 <1Potassium ppm 2 2 10 3
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12 8 6 7Copper ppm 2 <1 <1 2Lead ppm <1 0 2 0Tin ppm <1 <1 1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 1 1 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 15 28 25 22Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2124 1897 1110 1940Magnesium ppm 170 380 345 168Zinc ppm 1121 1148 820 1101Phosphorus ppm 902 980 621 941Barium ppm 0 2 0 0Boron ppm 4 6 21 58

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8879 [WUSCAR] 05898388 (Generated: 07/18/2023 02:21:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM FEHR - VOLVO8879
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC160E 314382\Diesel Engine [VCP416345] 07 Jul 2023 @ 2662.0 hrs

