
[[10658 HERC RENTALS]] VOLVO L70H 624618 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP414500
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 10658 HERC RENTALS

HOFFMAN EQUIPMENT - LIONVILLE120 GORDON DRIVELIONVILLE, PAUS  19341Contact: JIM FEHRjim.fehr@hoffmanequip.comT: (610)363-9200F: (610)594-0829
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor. Wewere unable to perform a particlecount due to a high concentration ofparticles present in this sample.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. The ANlevel is acceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO8879Unique No: 10559869Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 17 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8879 [WUSCAR] 05898513 (Generated: 07/18/2023 03:47:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM FEHR - VOLVO8879

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP414500 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 775 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.8 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.37 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 59 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 441 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 346 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8879 [WUSCAR] 05898513 (Generated: 07/18/2023 03:47:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM FEHR - VOLVO8879
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 624618\Hydraulic System [VCP414500] 11 Jul 2023 @ 775.0 hrs

