
[[SWO-063669]] VOLVO A60H A60H 340102 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP413247
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W90
Job No: SWO-063669

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is higher than normal.Confirm oil type.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10560328Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 17 Jul 2023
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05898972 (Generated: 07/18/2023 16:29:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413247 VCP410127 VCP393431 VCP389197Sample Date 11 Jul 2023 30 Mar 2023 15 Dec 2022 14 Sep 2022Machine Hours 8821 8292 7821 7310Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd N/ASample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 238 237.2 91.3 91.5
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 4 4 <1 <1Sodium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Potassium ppm <1 <1 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 56 56 45 38Copper ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 0 <1 <1Chromium ppm 2 2 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 2 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 41 32 19 19Magnesium ppm 3 5 1 1Zinc ppm 17 18 0 6Phosphorus ppm 1231 1145 1364 1337Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 200 228 203 237

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05898972 (Generated: 07/18/2023 16:29:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H A60H 340102\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP413247] 11 Jul 2023 @ 8821.0 hrs

