
[[A10672]] VOLVO L180H 5446 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP411852
Oil Type: MOBIL WB 102
Job No: A10672

COVANTA METAL MARKETING LLC500 MIDDLE DRFAIRLESS HILLS, PAUS  19030Contact: J.P.
T: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: COVFAIUnique No: 10560365Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 17 Jul 2023
Report Id: COVFAI [WUSCAR] 05899009 (Generated: 07/18/2023 17:01:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: J.P. ? - COVFAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP411852 VCP399126 --- ---Sample Date 10 Jul 2023 03 Feb 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 6010 5041 --- ---Oil Hours 2000 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.3 42.1 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 14 12 --- ---Sodium ppm 1 2 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 21 29 --- ---Copper ppm 2 1 --- ---Lead ppm <1 0 --- ---Tin ppm <1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 1 1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4262 4343 --- ---Magnesium ppm 17 17 --- ---Zinc ppm 1732 1751 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1379 1383 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 126 147 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COVFAI [WUSCAR] 05899009 (Generated: 07/18/2023 17:01:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: J.P. ? - COVFAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 5446\Front Axle [VCP411852] 10 Jul 2023 @ 6010.0 hrs

