
[[A10652]] VOLVO EC160E 310440 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP411858
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILUBE HD 80W90
Job No: A10652

K C CONSTRUCTION1737 STOUT DRIVEIVYLAND, PAUS  18974Contact: DUKE D.duked@kcconstruct.comT: (267)784-7337F:  x:
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.The ironlevel has decreased, but is stillabnormal. All other component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. Confirm oil type. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: KCCIVYUnique No: 10560372Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 17 Jul 2023
Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 05899016 (Generated: 07/18/2023 04:38:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP411858 VCP363743 VCP261767 VCP250217Sample Date 07 Jul 2023 27 Jan 2023 27 Feb 2020 19 Jul 2019Machine Hours 3200 2090 900 575Oil Hours 1000 1500 500 575Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL SEVERE SEVERE
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 313 531.7 293 197
 CONTAMINATIONWater % --- 0.373 --- ---Silicon ppm 51 19 896 1044Sodium ppm 0 15 6 6Potassium ppm 2 24 50 63
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 681 1061 961 1821Copper ppm 2 1 1 0Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 5Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 7 17 254 250Chromium ppm 2 17 7 17Molybdenum ppm <1 1 0 0Nickel ppm 2 2 3 4Titanium ppm <1 <1 16 19Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 3 13 10 21Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 10 27 105 62Magnesium ppm 0 12 32 13Zinc ppm 10 14 41 8Phosphorus ppm 657 270 817 329Barium ppm 0 131 1 0Boron ppm 7 0 99 1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 05899016 (Generated: 07/18/2023 04:38:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC160E 310440\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP411858] 07 Jul 2023 @ 3200.0 hrs

