
[[SWO-063645 APAC/MIDS]] VOLVO L180H 5494 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP424610
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: SWO-063645 APAC/MIDS

COWIN EQUIPMENT COMPANY2238 PINSON VALLEY PARKWAYBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35217Contact: BRANTLY CLAYbclay@cowin.comT: F: (205)856-2106
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8528Unique No: 10560382Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 17 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8528 [WUSCAR] 05899026 (Generated: 07/18/2023 03:05:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANTLY CLAY - VOLVO8528

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP424610 VCP410148 VCP368397 VCP365460Sample Date 07 Jul 2023 03 Apr 2023 10 Nov 2022 25 Aug 2022Machine Hours 3620 3078 2519 3182Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 39.1 39.1 40.1 39.6
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 12 12 11 10Sodium ppm 9 10 9 8Potassium ppm 1 0 0 3
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 106 91 70 54Copper ppm 24 22 18 14Lead ppm <1 0 1 <1Tin ppm <1 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 1 1 <1 2Chromium ppm 4 3 2 2Molybdenum ppm 2 2 2 2Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 5 5 3 3Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3861 3545 3669 3563Magnesium ppm 13 11 13 8Zinc ppm 1626 1432 1502 1511Phosphorus ppm 1348 1231 1267 1257Barium ppm 0 0 0 <1Boron ppm 112 121 116 133

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8528 [WUSCAR] 05899026 (Generated: 07/18/2023 03:05:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANTLY CLAY - VOLVO8528
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 5494\Front Axle [VCP424610] 07 Jul 2023 @ 3620.0 hrs

