
[[306218]] VOLVO A40G 352961 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP417837
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 306218

ALTA EQUIPMENT5985 COURT STREET ROADSYRACUSE, NYUS  13206Contact: JIM STRIGLEJIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COMT: (315)437-2611F: (315)434-9471
Diagnosis
The filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. Moderateconcentration of visible dirt/debrispresent in the fluid. The condition ofthe fluid is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: VOLVO0142Unique No: 10560400Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 18 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05899044 (Generated: 07/18/2023 17:14:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP417837 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2532 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.7 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 11 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 32 --- --- ---Copper ppm 13 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 17 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 89 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm <1 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 228 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 92 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05899044 (Generated: 07/18/2023 17:14:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352961\Transmission [VCP417837] 11 Jul 2023 @ 2532.0 hrs

