
[[SWO-063645 APAC/MIDS]] VOLVO L180H 5494 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP424608
Oil Type: DEXRON III
Job No: SWO-063645 APAC/MIDS

COWIN EQUIPMENT COMPANY2238 PINSON VALLEY PARKWAYBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35217Contact: BRANTLY CLAYbclay@cowin.comT: F: (205)856-2106
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8528Unique No: 10560401Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 18 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8528 [WUSCAR] 05899045 (Generated: 07/18/2023 16:27:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANTLY CLAY - VOLVO8528

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP424608 VCP410191 VCP369491 VCP375639Sample Date 07 Jul 2023 03 Apr 2023 10 Nov 2022 25 Aug 2022Machine Hours 3620 3078 2519 3182Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.5 27.4 27.2 27.8
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 9 9 10 10Sodium ppm 4 4 4 2Potassium ppm 1 2 0 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 86 82 67 64Copper ppm 10 8 8 8Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1Tin ppm <1 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 2 <1 <1 1Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 0 0 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 5 5 4 4Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 80 87 78 74Magnesium ppm 0 8 1 1Zinc ppm 17 13 9 14Phosphorus ppm 188 191 180 176Barium ppm 4 0 2 6Boron ppm 61 64 64 79

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8528 [WUSCAR] 05899045 (Generated: 07/18/2023 16:27:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANTLY CLAY - VOLVO8528
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 5494\Transmission (Auto) [VCP424608] 07 Jul 2023 @ 3620.0 hrs

