
[[4017HO]] VOLVO EC220EL 314082 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP402089
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: 4017HO

LCSWMA - LANCASTER COUNTY SOLID WASTE1299 HARRISBURG PIKELANCASTER, PAUS  17604Contact: ROGER RUSSINrrussin@lcswma.orgT: (717)735-0166F: (717)735-0197
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Thecarboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The glycol level isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: LANLANPAUnique No: 10560485Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 18 Jul 2023
Report Id: LANLANPA [WUSCAR] 05899129 (Generated: 08/10/2023 13:22:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROGER RUSSIN - LANLANPA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP402089 VCP335958 VCP305108 VCP270624Sample Date 11 Jul 2023 04 Nov 2021 23 Mar 2021 04 Jun 2020Machine Hours 6856 4319 3056 1966Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.33 7.33 7.69 7.87Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT 0 0 0Percentage Glycol % 49.8 47 46 45Freezing Point °C -33 -31 -29 -26
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal normal normal normalCoolant Color Yllow Yllow Green Yllow

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LANLANPA [WUSCAR] 05899129 (Generated: 08/10/2023 13:22:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROGER RUSSIN - LANLANPA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC220EL 314082\Coolant [VCP402089] 11 Jul 2023 @ 6856.0 hrs

