
[[351]] JOHN DEERE 350G 811711 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP396777
Oil Type: SHELL TELLUS S2 MX 46
Job No: 351

TOTAL DEVELOPMENT SOLUTIONS LLC7805 PROGRESS CTGAINESVILLE, VAUS  20155Contact: JOE SEALEjseale@totaldevelopmentsolutions.comT: (703)222-0497F: (703)753-4586
Diagnosis
Recommend drain oil if not alreadydone. Reduce drain interval to 2000hours or drain and flush and userecommended zinc free oil.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.The amount and size of particulatespresent in the system are acceptable.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Zinc levelabove manufacturer’srecommendations. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid.

Depot: TOTGAIUnique No: 10560643Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 18 Jul 2023
Report Id: TOTGAI [WUSCAR] 05899287 (Generated: 07/18/2023 17:04:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE SEALE - TOTGAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP396777 VCP231102 VCP217353 ---Sample Date 05 Jul 2023 05 Oct 2018 18 Oct 2017 ---Machine Hours 10120 3006 1321 ---Oil Hours 250 1000 1321 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 46.4 45.67 46.11 ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.40 0.337 0.149 ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 4679 24224 17294 ---Particles >6µm 49 2127 1565 ---Particles >14µm 4 86 74 ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 19/13/9 22/18/14 21/18/13 ---Silicon ppm 5 1 2 ---Sodium ppm <1 0 0 ---Potassium ppm 0 0 6 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 8 4 ---Copper ppm 2 1 <1 ---Lead ppm 0 0 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 2 1 <1 ---Chromium ppm 9 0 0 ---Molybdenum ppm 5 <1 0 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 0 ---Silver ppm <1 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 0 0 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 172 32 3 ---Magnesium ppm 54 0 0 ---Zinc ppm 264 100 18 ---Phosphorus ppm 413 434 520 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 4 <1 <1 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TOTGAI [WUSCAR] 05899287 (Generated: 07/18/2023 17:04:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE SEALE - TOTGAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	JOHN DEERE JOHN DEERE 350G 811711\Hydraulic System [VCP396777] 05 Jul 2023 @ 10120.0 hrs

