
[[361]] CATERPILLAR DLS01977 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP418896
Oil Type: DRYDENE LIMITED SLIP GEAR 80W90
Job No: 361

TOTAL DEVELOPMENT SOLUTIONS LLC7805 PROGRESS CTGAINESVILLE, VAUS  20155Contact: JOE SEALEjseale@totaldevelopmentsolutions.comT: (703)222-0497F: (703)753-4586
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: TOTGAIUnique No: 10560822Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 18 Jul 2023
Report Id: TOTGAI [WUSCAR] 05899466 (Generated: 07/18/2023 17:05:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE SEALE - TOTGAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP418896 --- --- ---Sample Date 26 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 6752 --- --- ---Oil Hours 1000 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 128 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.193 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 8 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 156 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 4 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 821 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 278 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 502 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 2 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TOTGAI [WUSCAR] 05899466 (Generated: 07/18/2023 17:05:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE SEALE - TOTGAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CATERPILLAR CATERPILLAR DLS01977\Swing Drive [VCP418896] 26 Jun 2023 @ 6752.0 hrs

