
VOLVO L220H 3440 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP419625
Oil Type: PENNZOIL DEXRON MERCON ATF FLUID
Job No:

COVANTA ENERGY141 CRANBERRY HWYWEST WAREHAM, MAUS  02576Contact: SAWYERssawyer@woodcomachinery.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: COVWESUnique No: 10560826Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 17 Jul 2023
Report Id: COVWES [WUSCAR] 05899470 (Generated: 07/17/2023 17:20:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? SAWYER - COVWES

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP419625 VCP411224 VCP382239 VCP362662Sample Date 11 Jul 2023 17 May 2023 24 Mar 2023 06 Feb 2023Machine Hours 3675 2728 1802 917Oil Hours 949 931 885 917Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 26.1 26.3 26.6 27.7
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 3 3 7 7Sodium ppm 1 2 <1 3Potassium ppm 0 2 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 48 35 37 39Copper ppm 2 2 3 6Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 0 <1 0Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 1 <1 3 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 1 3Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 102 93 110 81Magnesium ppm 4 1 5 2Zinc ppm 9 0 17 21Phosphorus ppm 254 237 257 178Barium ppm 0 0 0 1Boron ppm 103 116 100 80

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COVWES [WUSCAR] 05899470 (Generated: 07/17/2023 17:20:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? SAWYER - COVWES
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 3440\Transmission (Auto) [VCP419625] 11 Jul 2023 @ 3675.0 hrs

