
[[R22436 MAZZA]] VOLVO L45H 4122107 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP390284
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: R22436 MAZZA

HOFFMAN EQUIPMENT INC300 S RANDOLPHVILLE RDPISCATAWAY, NJUS  08854Contact: IOANA BODOCHIioana.bodochi@hoffmanequip.comT: F: (732)968-8371
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: HOFPISNJUnique No: 10560871Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 18 Jul 2023
Report Id: HOFPISNJ [WUSCAR] 05899515 (Generated: 07/18/2023 13:43:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: IOANA BODOCHI - HOFPISNJ

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP390284 --- --- ---Sample Date 10 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 9468 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 14.6 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.1 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 121 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 2.8 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 123 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 88 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 56 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 56 --- --- ---Copper ppm 7 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 9 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 47 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1832 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 665 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1284 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1026 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 30 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: HOFPISNJ [WUSCAR] 05899515 (Generated: 07/18/2023 13:43:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: IOANA BODOCHI - HOFPISNJ
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L45H 4122107\Diesel Engine [VCP390284] 10 Jul 2023 @ 9468.0 hrs

