
[[10732]] VOLVO A40G 341662 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP416445
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER GEAR OIL 75W-80-GO102
Job No: 10732

K C CONSTRUCTION1737 STOUT DRIVEIVYLAND, PAUS  18974Contact: DUKE D.duked@kcconstruct.comT: (267)784-7337F:  x:
Diagnosis
 

Depot: KCCIVYUnique No: 10561641Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 20 Jul 2023
Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 05900285 (Generated: 07/20/2023 08:28:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416445 VCP384283 VCP278578 ---Sample Date 12 Jul 2023 09 Nov 2022 09 Aug 2021 ---Machine Hours 7012 6440 5380 ---Oil Hours 0 2000 1000 ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status NORMAL ATTENTION ATTENTION ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 49.2 50.0 49.76 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 6 9 4 ---Sodium ppm 1 4 3 ---Potassium ppm 2 0 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 271 779 142 ---Copper ppm 3 4 3 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm <1 3 0 ---Chromium ppm 3 11 1 ---Molybdenum ppm 4 14 2 ---Nickel ppm 1 3 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 <1 ---Manganese ppm 6 16 4 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 400 385 424 ---Magnesium ppm 0 4 3 ---Zinc ppm 132 152 157 ---Phosphorus ppm 2030 1976 2092 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 205 205 239 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 05900285 (Generated: 07/20/2023 08:28:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 341662\Front Axle [VCP416445] 12 Jul 2023 @ 7012.0 hrs

