
[[SWA308814]] VOLVO L120H 632734 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP410083
Oil Type: AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 46
Job No: SWA308814

PRECAST WALL SYSTEMS1888 NW 22 COURTPOMPANO BEACH, FLUS  33069Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: F: 
Diagnosis
The filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. The fluid wasnot specified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 46.  Pleaseconfirm. All component wear rates are normal.There is a moderate amount of silt(particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. The oil is stillserviceable provided that thecontaminant(s) can be reduced toacceptable levels.

Depot: PREPOMUnique No: 10562564Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 19 Jul 2023
Report Id: PREPOM [WUSCAR] 05901208 (Generated: 07/19/2023 09:42:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - PREPOM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP410083 VCP349107 --- ---Sample Date 13 Jul 2023 29 Dec 2021 --- ---Machine Hours 2433 1581 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 48.2 44.0 --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.34 0.446 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 11394 21890 --- ---Particles >6µm 2087 5491 --- ---Particles >14µm 71 508 --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 21/18/13 22/20/16 --- ---Silicon ppm 2 3 --- ---Sodium ppm 1 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2 3 --- ---Copper ppm 2 2 --- ---Lead ppm 1 3 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 0 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 0 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 68 101 --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 1 --- ---Zinc ppm 419 401 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 326 334 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 0 3 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PREPOM [WUSCAR] 05901208 (Generated: 07/19/2023 09:42:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - PREPOM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 632734\Hydraulic System [VCP410083] 13 Jul 2023 @ 2433.0 hrs

