
[[X47172]] VOLVO ECR580 210723 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP416482
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: X47172

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Lake CharlesPO BOX 16955LAKE CHARLES, LAUS  70616Contact: TINA LEDOUXtledoux@scottcompanies.comT: (337)433-9811F: (318)433-6623
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.Aluminum, chromium,copper and iron ppm levels areabnormal. Cylinder wear is indicated.Ring wear is indicated. Bearingand/or bushing wear is indicated.There is a moderate amount of visiblesilt present in the sample. There is amoderate concentration of dirtpresent in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. The oil is nolonger serviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO6244Unique No: 10562575Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 19 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO6244 [WUSCAR] 05901219 (Generated: 07/19/2023 18:07:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TINA LEDOUX - VOLVO6244

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416482 --- --- ---Sample Date 13 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2639 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.0 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.14 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 545 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1036 --- --- ---Copper ppm 212 --- --- ---Lead ppm 8 --- --- ---Tin ppm 6 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 38 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 11 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 5 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 7 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 8 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 92 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 377 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 378 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6244 [WUSCAR] 05901219 (Generated: 07/19/2023 18:07:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TINA LEDOUX - VOLVO6244
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR580 210723\Hydraulic System [VCP416482] 13 Jul 2023 @ 2639.0 hrs

