
[[W14409]] VOLVO L110H 631888 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP424374
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: W14409

HOUSBY HEAVY EQUIPMENT, LLC4410 SE 4 MILE DRANKENY, IAUS  50021Contact: RANDY VANDERLEESTrvanderleest@housby.comT: F: (515)964-2865
Diagnosis
We advise that you perform a filterservice, and use off-line filtration toimprove the cleanliness of the systemfluid. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateamount of particulates (2 to 100microns in size) present in the oil. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.The oil is still serviceable providedthat the contaminant(s) can bereduced to acceptable levels.

Depot: VOLVO0080Unique No: 10562576Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 19 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0080 [WUSCAR] 05901220 (Generated: 07/19/2023 09:30:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY VANDERLEEST - VOLVO0080

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP424374 VCP380810 VCP382343 VCP362556Sample Date 10 Jul 2023 27 Feb 2023 06 Dec 2022 25 Jul 2022Machine Hours 6567 6011 5509 5005Oil Hours 500 2000 500 1000Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.0 41.5 41.7 41.9Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.37 0.39 0.36 0.43
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 6554 2578 3338 11547Particles >6µm 2397 711 769 2930Particles >14µm 230 38 38 223ISO 4406:1999 (c) 20/18/15 19/17/12 19/17/12 21/19/15Silicon ppm 12 3 3 2Sodium ppm 2 0 2 2Potassium ppm 0 1 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 27 6 7 6Copper ppm 4 3 2 2Lead ppm 0 1 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 <1 0 0Chromium ppm 1 2 2 2Molybdenum ppm 1 2 2 2Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 0 0Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 114 125 136 130Magnesium ppm 6 12 11 11Zinc ppm 462 461 455 437Phosphorus ppm 369 341 359 344Barium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Boron ppm 0 <1 <1 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0080 [WUSCAR] 05901220 (Generated: 07/19/2023 09:30:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY VANDERLEEST - VOLVO0080
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 631888\Hydraulic System [VCP424374] 10 Jul 2023 @ 6567.0 hrs

