
[[W07012960]] VOLVO A45G 342207 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP423614
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: W07012960

McClung-Logan Virginia LLC- RICHMOND1345 MOUNTAIN ROADGLEN ALLEN, VAUS  23060Contact: KYLE RATLIFFEKRATLIFFE@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: F: (804)266-1611
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak. Check forlow coolant level. Oil and filterchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Sodium and/orpotassium levels are high. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: VOLVO8882Unique No: 10563375Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 20 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05902019 (Generated: 07/20/2023 16:06:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP423614 VCP399448 VCP246332 VCP372946Sample Date 28 Jun 2023 02 May 2023 09 Dec 2022 28 Jul 2022Machine Hours 9652 9278 8521 7899Oil Hours 500 0 600 0Oil Changed Changed N/A Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.9 12.7 12.8 12.6Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.9 5.3 7.7 7.3Oxidation (PA) % 68 63 80 61
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.4 0.4 0.6 0.6Nitration (PA) % 90 77 93 81Sulfation (PA) % 56 55 63 59Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 17 6 3 5Sodium ppm 499 3 0 2Potassium ppm 209 3 2 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 19 11 10 11Copper ppm 2 2 3 5Lead ppm 5 2 1 1Tin ppm 1 1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 7 3 4 4Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 62 65 46 43Nickel ppm 1 1 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1428 2081 1384 2013Magnesium ppm 727 173 569 224Zinc ppm 971 1239 878 1106Phosphorus ppm 773 1009 693 906Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 17 30 25 32

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05902019 (Generated: 07/20/2023 16:06:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 342207\Diesel Engine [VCP423614] 28 Jun 2023 @ 9652.0 hrs

