
[[63653 SRM]] VOLVO L260H VCP 418047 (S/N NOT GIVEN) - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP418047
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 63653 SRM

COWIN EQUIPMENT COMPANY INC - GUNTERSVILLE15101 ALABAMA HWY 20MADISON, ALUS  35756Contact: RANDY HARRISRHARRIS@COWIN.COMT: (256)298-2322F: (256)355-5250
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.The copper level isabnormal. In the absence of othersignificant wear metals, suspectcopper due to sources other thanwear (i.e. cooling core). All othermetal levels are typical for a newcomponent breaking in. Fuel contentnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: COWMADUnique No: 10563380Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 23 Jul 2023
Report Id: COWMAD [WUSCAR] 05902024 (Generated: 07/23/2023 17:53:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY HARRIS - COWMAD

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP418047 --- --- ---Sample Date 28 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 496 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.5 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.2 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 58 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 72 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 53 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 0.4 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 21 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12 --- --- ---Copper ppm 338 --- --- ---Lead ppm 4 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 79 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2228 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 132 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1255 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1058 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 96 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COWMAD [WUSCAR] 05902024 (Generated: 07/23/2023 17:53:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY HARRIS - COWMAD
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L260H VCP 418047 (S/N NOT GIVEN)\Diesel Engine [VCP418047] 28 Jun 2023 @ 496.0 hrs

