
[[W07013015 CHESTERFLD]] VOLVO L90H 625196 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP418124
Oil Type: VOLVO AT 102
Job No: W07013015 CHESTERFLD

McClung-Logan Virginia LLC- RICHMOND1345 MOUNTAIN ROADGLEN ALLEN, VAUS  23060Contact: KYLE RATLIFFEKRATLIFFE@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: F: (804)266-1611
Diagnosis
TRANSMISSION FAILURE.The ironlevel is abnormal. The aluminum levelis severe. Bearing, clutch or torqueconverter wear is indicated. Elementallevel of silicon (Si) above normal.

Depot: VOLVO8882Unique No: 10564028Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 21 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05902672 (Generated: 07/21/2023 12:37:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP418124 VCP405379 VCP349740 ---Sample Date 14 Jul 2023 02 Jun 2023 22 Apr 2022 ---Machine Hours 6338 6175 4191 ---Oil Hours 0 2000 0 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed ---Sample Status SEVERE ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.9 27.9 26.1 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 21 19 7 ---Sodium ppm 8 4 9 ---Potassium ppm 3 2 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 197 156 271 ---Copper ppm 20 19 44 ---Lead ppm <1 <1 0 ---Tin ppm <1 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 94 83 8 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 0 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 0 ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 6 4 7 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 89 84 112 ---Magnesium ppm 0 3 2 ---Zinc ppm 104 104 97 ---Phosphorus ppm 231 207 199 ---Barium ppm 0 2 0 ---Boron ppm 52 43 22 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05902672 (Generated: 07/21/2023 12:37:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 625196\Transmission (Auto) [VCP418124] 14 Jul 2023 @ 6338.0 hrs

