
[[SVC049435]] VOLVO L60H 622420 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP407150
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: SVC049435

TYLER EQUIPMENT CORPORATION1980 BERLIN TURNPIKEBERLIN, CTUS  06037Contact: KYLE SCHMITZkschmitz@tylerequipment.comT: (860)356-0840F: (860)828-6727
Diagnosis
We advise that you follow the  waterdrain-off procedure for thiscomponent. We recommend youservice and check the fuel filters formucous-like deposits.  Check withfuel supplier for biocides available todestroy the microorganisms in thefuel system.All metal levels arenormal indicating no corrosion in thesystem. Excessive free water present.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the fuel.Possible bacteria or fungus (yeastand/or mold) indicated in the sample.The condition of the fuel isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0005Unique No: 10564053Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 26 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0005 [WUSCAR] 05902697 (Generated: 07/27/2023 06:37:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE SCHMITZ - VOLVO0005

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP407150 --- --- ---Sample Date 18 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.59 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.006 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0005 [WUSCAR] 05902697 (Generated: 07/27/2023 06:37:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE SCHMITZ - VOLVO0005
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L60H 622420\Diesel Fuel [VCP407150] 18 Jul 2023 @ .0 hrs

