
[[W07013009 SHADE TREE]] AVANT 420 751891450 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP418009
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: W07013009 SHADE TREE

McClung-Logan Virginia LLC- RICHMOND1345 MOUNTAIN ROADGLEN ALLEN, VAUS  23060Contact: KYLE RATLIFFEKRATLIFFE@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: F: (804)266-1611
Diagnosis
We advise that you follow the waterdrain-off procedure for thiscomponent, and use off-line filtrationto improve the cleanliness of thesystem fluid. We recommend youservice and check the fuel filters formucous-like deposits.  Check withfuel supplier for biocides available todestroy the microorganisms in thefuel system.All metal levels arenormal indicating no corrosion in thesystem. Excessive free water present.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the fuel.Possible bacteria or fungus (yeastand/or mold) indicated in the sample.The fuel is no longer serviceable dueto the presence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO8882Unique No: 10564055Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 26 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05902699 (Generated: 07/27/2023 12:17:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP418009 --- --- ---Sample Date 14 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1435 --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.46 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.012 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05902699 (Generated: 07/27/2023 12:17:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	AVANT AVANT 420 751891450\Diesel Fuel [VCP418009] 14 Jul 2023 @ 1435.0 hrs

