
[[4019HO]] VOLVO L180G 5380 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP408016
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 4019HO

LCSWMA - LANCASTER COUNTY SOLID WASTE1299 HARRISBURG PIKELANCASTER, PAUS  17604Contact: ROGER RUSSINrrussin@lcswma.orgT: (717)735-0166F: (717)735-0197
Diagnosis
We advise you check for source ofcontamination.All component wearrates are normal. No othercontaminants were detected in theoil. The additive levels indicate themixing of two different brands, ortypes of oil.

Depot: LANLANPAUnique No: 10564883Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 24 Jul 2023
Report Id: LANLANPA [WUSCAR] 05903527 (Generated: 07/24/2023 13:36:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROGER RUSSIN - LANLANPA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP408016 VCP298544 VCP293685 VCP296538Sample Date 13 Jul 2023 22 Mar 2021 16 Dec 2020 16 Dec 2020Machine Hours 3914 1994 1546 1481Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.1 41.4 39.1 40.4
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 15 12 10 11Sodium ppm 6 6 11 9Potassium ppm 0 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 73 40 49 35Copper ppm 3 <1 6 <1Lead ppm <1 <1 0 0Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 1 1 1Chromium ppm 4 2 2 2Molybdenum ppm 1 2 3 3Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 <1Manganese ppm 2 3 4 3Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2102 3212 3865 3976Magnesium ppm 12 7 10 15Zinc ppm 991 1323 1573 1591Phosphorus ppm 813 1137 1294 1277Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 76 93 122 125

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LANLANPA [WUSCAR] 05903527 (Generated: 07/24/2023 13:36:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROGER RUSSIN - LANLANPA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180G 5380\Front Axle [VCP408016] 13 Jul 2023 @ 3914.0 hrs

