
[[SWO64038]] VOLVO A45G 352734 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP290238
Oil Type: DEXRON III
Job No: SWO64038

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
The filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Moderate concentration ofvisible metal present. All componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10564897Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 24 Jul 2023
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05903541 (Generated: 07/24/2023 15:24:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP290238 VCP382597 VCP380793 VCP390110Sample Date 17 Jul 2023 27 Apr 2023 17 Jan 2023 12 Oct 2022Machine Hours 3875 3463 2987 2471Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.5 28.6 29.3 29.6
 CONTAMINATIONWater % --- --- 0.462 0.776Silicon ppm 3 3 7 6Sodium ppm 5 0 7 4Potassium ppm <1 2 3 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 79 64 99 56Copper ppm 52 44 63 27Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 4 3 5 2Aluminum ppm 4 1 7 4Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm 8 6 8 4Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 1 2 2Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 105 82 79 70Magnesium ppm 3 4 6 2Zinc ppm 205 177 85 56Phosphorus ppm 182 162 190 186Barium ppm 0 0 <1 2Boron ppm 29 43 65 73

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05903541 (Generated: 07/24/2023 15:24:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352734\Transmission (Auto) [VCP290238] 17 Jul 2023 @ 3875.0 hrs

