
[[X27914]] VOLVO A25G 752511 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCE091003
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: X27914

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Shreveport945 NORTH MARKET STREETSHREVEPORT, LAUS  71107-6744Contact: KENNY COLEMANkcoleman@scottcompanies.comT: (318)226-9696F: (318)698-2295
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted.Allcomponent wear rates are normal fortime on oil. Appearance is milky.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal indicating ingress of sealmaterial. There is a lightconcentration of water present in theoil. The oil viscosity is lower thannormal. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO2603Unique No: 10565973Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 26 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO2603 [WUSCAR] 05904617 (Generated: 07/26/2023 13:35:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY COLEMAN - VOLVO2603

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE091003 --- --- ---Sample Date 19 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 947 --- --- ---Oil Hours 947 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 49.1 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.214 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 74 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 7 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 7 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 280 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 17 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 20 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 10 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 55 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 8 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 285 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 2712 --- --- ---Barium ppm 6 --- --- ---Boron ppm 216 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2603 [WUSCAR] 05904617 (Generated: 07/26/2023 13:35:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY COLEMAN - VOLVO2603
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 752511\Drop Box [VCE091003] 19 Jul 2023 @ 947.0 hrs

