
[[579653]] VOLVO A40G 353131 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP422693
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 579653

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: ROBERT TURNERrturner@ripatampa.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Elemental level of silicon(Si) above normal indicating ingressof seal material. The oil viscosity islower than normal. Confirm oil type.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 10566029Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 25 Jul 2023
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05904673 (Generated: 07/25/2023 10:24:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT TURNER - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP422693 --- --- ---Sample Date 13 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2234 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 49.1 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 68 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 10 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 255 --- --- ---Copper ppm 8 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 13 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 82 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 134 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 2385 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 110 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05904673 (Generated: 07/25/2023 10:24:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT TURNER - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 353131\Drop Box [VCP422693] 13 Jul 2023 @ 2234.0 hrs

