
[[SWA298751]] VOLVO A45G 342523 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP419035
Oil Type: VOLVO WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL
Job No: SWA298751

QGS - QUALITY GRASSES SERV/TCF LEASING17502 CR 672LITHIA, FLUS  33547Contact: GARY ROGERSgrogers@qgsdevelopment.comT: (813)323-4119F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: QUALITFLUnique No: 10566406Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 25 Jul 2023
Report Id: QUALITFL [WUSCAR] 05905050 (Generated: 07/25/2023 13:09:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GARY ROGERS - QUALITFL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP419035 --- --- ---Sample Date 18 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 6542 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 14 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 15 --- --- ---Copper ppm 125 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4237 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 18 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1712 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1350 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 145 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: QUALITFL [WUSCAR] 05905050 (Generated: 07/25/2023 13:09:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GARY ROGERS - QUALITFL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 342523\Wet Disc Brake [VCP419035] 18 Jul 2023 @ 6542.0 hrs

