
[[SWA311936]] VOLVO L180H 5522 - FILTER - TANK DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP083830
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: SWA311936

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY1035 WYLIE DRIVEBLOOMINGTON, ILUS  61705Contact: MIKE MARTINmike.martin@altaequipment.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time.All metal levels arenormal indicating no corrosion in thesystem. The water content isnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fuel. Thecondition of the fuel is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO5054Unique No: 10572550Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 03 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO5054 [WUSCAR] 05905898 (Generated: 08/07/2023 10:27:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MARTIN - VOLVO5054

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP083830 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 571 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 4 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.66 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.018 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5054 [WUSCAR] 05905898 (Generated: 08/07/2023 10:27:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MARTIN - VOLVO5054
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 5522 - FILTER\Tank Diesel Fuel [VCP083830] 20 Jul 2023 @ 571.0 hrs

