
[[9286]] VOLVO L110H 632191 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP367862
Oil Type: CHEVRON 15W40
Job No: 9286

PLEASANT EXCAVATING COMPANY INC24024 FREDERICK ROADCLARKSBURG, MDUS  20871Contact: H TRENTHTRENT@PLEASANTS.ORGT: (301)252-5635F: 
Diagnosis
 

Depot: PLECLAUnique No: 10573007Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 27 Jul 2023
Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 05906355 (Generated: 07/27/2023 10:30:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP367862 VCP383736 --- ---Sample Date 17 Jul 2023 07 Nov 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 2117 843 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.3 12.6 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.5 10.3 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 70 82 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 0.2 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 70 65 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 62 66 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 9 24 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 4 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 20 27 --- ---Copper ppm 15 18 --- ---Lead ppm 3 5 --- ---Tin ppm 2 3 --- ---Aluminum ppm 11 47 --- ---Chromium ppm 2 5 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 89 40 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm <1 1 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1532 1571 --- ---Magnesium ppm 499 616 --- ---Zinc ppm 1198 1093 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 976 942 --- ---Barium ppm 0 5 --- ---Boron ppm 285 49 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 05906355 (Generated: 07/27/2023 10:30:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 632191\Diesel Engine [VCP367862] 17 Jul 2023 @ 2117.0 hrs

