
[[9242]] VOLVO L110F 4768 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP367861
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 9242

REPUBLIC SERVICES INC10710 PHILADELPHIA RDPERRY HALL, MDUS  21128Contact: RYAN WARDrward7@republicservices.comT: (443)793-7240F: (410)347-5157
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thefluid viscosity is higher than normal.This plus the additive levels indicatesthe addition of a different brand, ortype of oil.

Depot: REPPERUnique No: 10573641Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 27 Jul 2023
Report Id: REPPER [WUSCAR] 05906989 (Generated: 07/27/2023 14:04:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WARD - REPPER

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP367861 VCP344627 VCP281460 VCP323946Sample Date 13 Jul 2023 06 Dec 2021 27 Sep 2021 04 Jun 2021Machine Hours 11933 10141 9912 9705Oil Hours 0 0 0 1000Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 144 31.0 29.0 24.2
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 11 2 2 2Sodium ppm <1 1 1 1Potassium ppm 0 <1 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm <1 2 3 7Copper ppm 2 <1 <1 1Lead ppm 0 0 2 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 1 <1 <1 0Chromium ppm 0 0 0 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 0 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3652 332 87 120Magnesium ppm 10 2 2 1Zinc ppm 1121 60 6 8Phosphorus ppm 897 252 180 173Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 7 82 86 72

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: REPPER [WUSCAR] 05906989 (Generated: 07/27/2023 14:04:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WARD - REPPER
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110F 4768\Transmission (Auto) [VCP367861] 13 Jul 2023 @ 11933.0 hrs

