
[[SPM580171 AM TERM]] VOLVO L60H 622214 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP420044
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: SPM580171 AM TERM

ALTA EQUIPMENT CO - ORLAND PARK5000 INDUSTRIAL HWYGARY, INUS  46406Contact: DAVE ENGDAVE.ENG@ALTG.COMT: (312)350-2560F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Light fuel dilution occurring. Noother contaminants were detected inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO8885Unique No: 10573968Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 27 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 05907316 (Generated: 07/27/2023 15:30:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP420044 VCP423140 --- ---Sample Date 10 Jul 2023 13 Jun 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 1180 1046 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed --- ---Sample Status NORMAL SEVERE --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.8 10.8 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.5 8.9 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 59 89 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 0.8 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 54 99 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 52 65 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % 1.6 10.4 --- ---Silicon ppm 4 10 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 3 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 43 --- ---Copper ppm 1 5 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 3 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 14 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 2 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 59 34 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1200 1470 --- ---Magnesium ppm 944 480 --- ---Zinc ppm 1259 1043 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1036 836 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 7 39 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 05907316 (Generated: 07/27/2023 15:30:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L60H 622214\Diesel Engine [VCP420044] 10 Jul 2023 @ 1180.0 hrs

