
[[23731]] VOLVO L180H 5514 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP420820
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 23731

MURRAY MINES2696 HIGHWAY 17ASUMMERVILLE, SCUS  29483Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (843)875-7465F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level has decreased, but is stillabnormal. In the absence of othersignificant wear metals, suspectcopper due to sources other thanwear (i.e. cooling core). All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: MURSUMUnique No: 10574163Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 28 Jul 2023
Report Id: MURSUM [WUSCAR] 05907511 (Generated: 07/28/2023 11:59:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - MURSUM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP420820 VCP388855 VCP383508 VCP339130Sample Date 21 Jul 2023 12 Dec 2022 22 Sep 2022 08 Mar 2022Machine Hours 4032 3039 2593 1490Oil Hours 1000 1000 500 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed N/ASample Status ABNORMAL MARGINAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.1 13.3 13.3 12.9Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.7 10.8 7.9 8.4Oxidation (PA) % 88 86 95 70
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 0.2 0.3 3Nitration (PA) % 80 69 93 93Sulfation (PA) % 64 67 68 72Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 4 7 6Sodium ppm 2 3 3 2Potassium ppm 0 0 1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 5 10 9Copper ppm 25 66 237 4Lead ppm 0 1 13 <1Tin ppm <1 2 2 2Aluminum ppm 2 1 0 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 43 35 39 41Nickel ppm <1 <1 1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1886 1710 1815 1821Magnesium ppm 547 440 437 522Zinc ppm 1236 1075 1088 1097Phosphorus ppm 969 936 950 949Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 17 44 18 27

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: MURSUM [WUSCAR] 05907511 (Generated: 07/28/2023 11:59:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - MURSUM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 5514\Diesel Engine [VCP420820] 21 Jul 2023 @ 4032.0 hrs

