
[[X36418]] 14RL00328 - FRONT LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP412348
Oil Type: GEAR OIL LS 80W90
Job No: X36418

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Baton Rouge10160 AIRLINE HWYBATON ROUGE, LAUS  70816Contact: BRENT CALDWELLbcaldwell@scottcompanies.comT: (225)293-3683F: (225)292-9658
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Gear wearis indicated. Bearing and/or bushingwear is indicated. All other metallevels are typical for a newcomponent breaking in. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO6242Unique No: 10574609Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 28 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO6242 [WUSCAR] 05907957 (Generated: 07/28/2023 17:52:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRENT CALDWELL - VOLVO6242

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412348 --- --- ---Sample Date 21 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 209 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 198 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 15 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 11 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 658 --- --- ---Copper ppm 192 --- --- ---Lead ppm 116 --- --- ---Tin ppm 3 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 8 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 201 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 7 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 37 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 7 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 56 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 492 --- --- ---Barium ppm 201 --- --- ---Boron ppm 5 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6242 [WUSCAR] 05907957 (Generated: 07/28/2023 17:52:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRENT CALDWELL - VOLVO6242
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TERRAMAC 14RL00328\Front Left Final Drive [VCP412348] 21 Jul 2023 @ 209.0 hrs

