
[[567884 MOSAIC]] VOLVO EC380EL 314879 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP417570
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 567884 MOSAIC

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: JOHN FARDELLAJFARDELLA@ALTAEQUIPFL.COMT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Gear wearis indicated. All other metal levels aretypical for a new componentbreaking in. Elemental levels ofsilicon (Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.The condition of the oil is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10574643Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 28 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05907991 (Generated: 07/28/2023 17:57:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP417570 --- --- ---Sample Date 28 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1116 --- --- ---Oil Hours 500 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 179 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 352 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1806 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 26 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 54 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 6 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 2 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 21 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 22 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 6 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 11 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 278 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05907991 (Generated: 07/28/2023 17:57:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC380EL 314879\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP417570] 28 Jun 2023 @ 1116.0 hrs

