
[[580970 PRINCE]] VOLVO L90H 626456 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP412610
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: 580970 PRINCE

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: Robert LaPlanterobert.laplante@altg.comT: (407)508-9736F: (407)659-8720
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain thefluid from the component if this hasnot already been done. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.The iron level is abnormal.Moderate concentration of visiblemetal present. There is no indicationof any contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 10574720Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 28 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05908068 (Generated: 07/28/2023 16:01:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412610 VCP395871 --- ---Sample Date 21 Jul 2023 26 Feb 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 1396 627 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.9 28.1 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 8 6 --- ---Sodium ppm 4 <1 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 201 123 --- ---Copper ppm 6 4 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 0 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 0 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 9 6 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 77 71 --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 37 32 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 202 181 --- ---Barium ppm <1 2 --- ---Boron ppm 72 69 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05908068 (Generated: 07/28/2023 16:01:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 626456\Transmission (Auto) [VCP412610] 21 Jul 2023 @ 1396.0 hrs

