
[[S50401247]] VOLVO A45G 342304 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP402058
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 90W140
Job No: S50401247

VCES- VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT22099 KNABE ROADCORONA, CAUS  92883Contact: OSCAR DEL CAMPOoscar.delcampo@vcesvolvo.comT: (951)277-7620F: (951)277-4550
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Test do not reveal causefor reported problem.All componentwear rates are normal. The watercontent is negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO4486Unique No: 10575046Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 28 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 05908394 (Generated: 07/28/2023 19:24:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: OSCAR DEL CAMPO - VOLVO4486

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP402058 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5500 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 310 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 177 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 19 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 6 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 12 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 9 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1150 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 202 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 05908394 (Generated: 07/28/2023 19:24:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: OSCAR DEL CAMPO - VOLVO4486
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 342304\Drop Box [VCP402058] 24 Jul 2023 @ 5500.0 hrs

