
[ASCENDUM MACHINERY 500HR CSA/CANDOR, NC] VOLVO L150H 2040 (S/N 6410) - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP404599
Oil Type: VOLVO VDS-4.5 Premium Motor Oil 15W40
Job No:

G S MATERIALS INCPO BOX 1335BURLINGTON, NCUS  27216Contact: KAREN NEWPORTGsmaterials@windstream.netT: (919)499-9322F: (919)499-2097
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. Oil and filter changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. Resample at the next serviceinterval to monitor.All componentwear rates are normal. There is amoderate amount of fuel present inthe oil. Fuel is present in the oil and islowering the viscosity. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: GANBURNCUnique No: 10575253Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 28 Jul 2023
Report Id: GANBURNC [WUSCAR] 05908601 (Generated: 07/28/2023 20:23:29) Rev: 1 Submitted By: ?

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP404599 VCP0005020 VCP361567 VCP0002425Sample Date 25 Jul 2023 20 Dec 2022 15 Sep 2022 15 Jun 2022Machine Hours 8961 8535 8087 7561Oil Hours 0 0 0 7561Oil Changed Changed N/A Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.8 12.8 13.3 10.21Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.4 10.2 9.8 10.5Oxidation (PA) % 57 70 64 78
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 0.2 0.3 0.2Nitration (PA) % 53 61 61 61Sulfation (PA) % 50 58 57 60Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 5.9 <1.0 <1.0 0.3Silicon ppm 6 10 6 8Sodium ppm 2 2 2 <1Potassium ppm 0 <1 1 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 9 10 7Copper ppm <1 1 1 1Lead ppm 0 1 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 2 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 7 4 3Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Molybdenum ppm 57 53 59 43Nickel ppm 0 <1 1 0Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1149 1397 1219 1601Magnesium ppm 921 734 810 467Zinc ppm 1256 1183 1246 1115Phosphorus ppm 1028 954 1020 905Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 6 19 11 44

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GANBURNC [WUSCAR] 05908601 (Generated: 07/28/2023 20:23:38) Rev: 1 Submitted By: ?
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 2040 (S/N 6410)\Diesel Engine [VCP404599] 25 Jul 2023 @ 8961.0 hrs

