
[[SWO-063977]] CATERPILLAR 769C O1X06337 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP369083
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: SWO-063977

WHITAKER CONTRACTING692 CONVICT CAMP RDGUNTERSVILLE, ALUS  35976Contact: BROTHER WHITAKERBrotherWhitaker@whitaker-contracting.comT: (256)298-3905F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: WHIGUNUnique No: 10575835Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Jul 2023
Report Id: WHIGUN [WUSCAR] 05909183 (Generated: 07/30/2023 11:33:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BROTHER WHITAKER - WHIGUN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP369083 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3379 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 58.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 42 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 146 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1337 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 19 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 776 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 688 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 7 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WHIGUN [WUSCAR] 05909183 (Generated: 07/30/2023 11:33:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BROTHER WHITAKER - WHIGUN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CATERPILLAR CATERPILLAR 769C O1X06337\Rear Axle [VCP369083] 24 Jul 2023 @ 3379.0 hrs

