
[ASCENDUM MACHINERY 500HR CSA/CANDOR, NC] VOLVO L150H 2040 (S/N 6410) - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP422168
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No:

G S MATERIALS INCPO BOX 1335BURLINGTON, NCUS  27216Contact: KAREN NEWPORTGsmaterials@windstream.netT: (919)499-9322F: (919)499-2097
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: GANBURNCUnique No: 10575872Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 28 Jul 2023
Report Id: GANBURNC [WUSCAR] 05909220 (Generated: 07/28/2023 20:24:24) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP422168 VCP05723526 VCP366282 VCP0000981Sample Date 25 Jul 2023 20 Dec 2022 15 Sep 2022 18 Mar 2022Machine Hours 8961 8535 8087 7023Oil Hours 0 0 0 2944Oil Changed Not Changd N/A Changed Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 29.2 28.2 26.1 37.6
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 3 3 3 4Sodium ppm 1 2 1 3Potassium ppm <1 <1 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 72 254 235Copper ppm 0 3 9 7Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm <1 <1 2 1Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 2 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 75 78 80 119Magnesium ppm 0 2 <1 0Zinc ppm 2 6 10 19Phosphorus ppm 212 190 157 179Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 101 89 68 59

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GANBURNC [WUSCAR] 05909220 (Generated: 07/28/2023 20:24:27) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 2040 (S/N 6410)\Transmission (Auto) [VCP422168] 25 Jul 2023 @ 8961.0 hrs

