
[[D44353 US SILICA]] VOLVO L350H 1146 - TRANSMISSION (MANUAL)

Sample No: VCP407297
Oil Type: TDTO FLUID SAE 30
Job No: D44353 US SILICA

ARING EQUIPMENT COMPANY INC - EAU CLAIREPO BOX 478EAU CLAIRE, WIUS  54702Contact: BRYAN KIRCHNERbkirchner@aring.comT: (715)835-6133F: (715)835-1230
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The wear metal levels donot reflect the reported failure. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the fluid. The condition of the fluidis acceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0071Unique No: 10575877Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0071 [WUSCAR] 05909225 (Generated: 07/30/2023 11:59:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRYAN KIRCHNER - VOLVO0071

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP407297 --- --- ---Sample Date 21 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 9608 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 89.1 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 12 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 --- --- ---Copper ppm 15 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2747 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 32 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1186 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 954 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 9 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0071 [WUSCAR] 05909225 (Generated: 07/30/2023 11:59:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRYAN KIRCHNER - VOLVO0071
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L350H 1146\Transmission (Manual) [VCP407297] 21 Jul 2023 @ 9608.0 hrs

