
VOLVO G946B 578070 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VC238564
Oil Type: CENEX MAXTRON 15W40
Job No:

TOWN OF WESTBORO4941 CENTER STREETWESTBORO, WIUS  54490Contact: JEFFREY PETERSONrmdjp@frontiernet.netT: (715)427-5867F: (715)427-5354
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: TOWWESWIUnique No: 10575970Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 28 Jul 2023
Report Id: TOWWESWI [WUSCAR] 05909318 (Generated: 07/28/2023 11:46:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JEFFREY PETERSON - TOWWESWI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VC238564 VC146643 VCE03365 VCE03385Sample Date 28 Jun 2023 27 Feb 2022 15 Aug 2018 14 Feb 2018Machine Hours 6044 5059 2627 2370Oil Hours 294 0 257 270Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 14.3 15.6 14.89 15.06Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.0 11.3 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 57 64 52 48
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 1.2 0.8 1.1 0.8Nitration (PA) % 70 68 69 58Sulfation (PA) % 54 58 50 47Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 4 6 7Sodium ppm 4 <1 2 4Potassium ppm 3 2 22 12
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 29 17 20 26Copper ppm 2 1 2 2Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 0Tin ppm <1 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 6 5 12 10Chromium ppm 1 <1 1 1Molybdenum ppm 69 65 58 57Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1197 1148 1034 1147Magnesium ppm 958 1054 1022 1037Zinc ppm 1331 1400 1106 1251Phosphorus ppm 1120 1210 899 1084Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 3 3 <1 <1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TOWWESWI [WUSCAR] 05909318 (Generated: 07/28/2023 11:46:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JEFFREY PETERSON - TOWWESWI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO G946B 578070\Diesel Engine [VC238564] 28 Jun 2023 @ 6044.0 hrs

