
DOOSAN HP1600 494124UEA - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP399631
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT (GREEN)
Job No:

VCES- VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT22099 KNABE ROADCORONA, CAUS  92883Contact: OSCAR DEL CAMPOoscar.delcampo@vcesvolvo.comT: (951)277-7620F: (951)277-4550
Diagnosis
We recommend drain system, andrefill with 50/50 antifreeze watermixture. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Theglycol level is higher than acceptable.The nitrite level is acceptable. The pHlevel of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: VOLVO4486Unique No: 10576294Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 31 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 05909642 (Generated: 07/31/2023 15:19:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: OSCAR DEL CAMPO - VOLVO4486

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP399631 --- --- ---Sample Date 26 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1161 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 9.45 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 712 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 71.4 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -66 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 05909642 (Generated: 07/31/2023 15:19:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: OSCAR DEL CAMPO - VOLVO4486
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	DOOSAN DOOSAN HP1600 494124UEA\Coolant [VCP399631] 26 Jul 2023 @ 1160.8 hrs

