
[[X27965]] CASE CX220E 8H1126 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP379760
Oil Type: CASE 10W40
Job No: X27965

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Shreveport945 NORTH MARKET STREETSHREVEPORT, LAUS  71107-6744Contact: MARILYN TIDWELLmtidwell@scottcompanies.comT: F: (318)677-2493
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor. No other corrective action isrecommended at this time.Metallevels are typical for a newcomponent breaking in. Light fueldilution occurring. No othercontaminants were detected in theoil. The BN result indicates that thereis suitable alkalinity remaining in theoil. The condition of the oil is suitablefor further service.

Depot: VOLVO2603Unique No: 10576318Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 31 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO2603 [WUSCAR] 05909666 (Generated: 07/31/2023 10:11:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARILYN TIDWELL - VOLVO2603

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP379760 --- --- ---Sample Date 26 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 492 --- --- ---Oil Hours 491 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.1 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.5 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 59 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 65 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 53 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 1.3 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 70 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 7 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 13 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 30 --- --- ---Copper ppm 18 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 54 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2280 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 307 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1195 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 940 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 62 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2603 [WUSCAR] 05909666 (Generated: 07/31/2023 10:11:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARILYN TIDWELL - VOLVO2603
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CASE CASE CX220E 8H1126\Diesel Engine [VCP379760] 26 Jul 2023 @ 492.0 hrs

