
[[10720]] VOLVO L150G 23510 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP416444
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 10720

COVANTA ENERGY10 HIGHLAND AVECHESTER, PAUS  19013Contact: LOADER SHOPjacoles@covantaenergy.comT: (610)497-8115F: (610)497-8042
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor. Pleasespecify the brand, type, and viscosityof the oil on your next sample.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: COVCHEUnique No: 10577009Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 31 Jul 2023
Report Id: COVCHE [WUSCAR] 05910357 (Generated: 07/31/2023 16:19:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LOADER SHOP - COVCHE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416444 VCP321600 --- ---Sample Date 20 Jul 2023 15 Jun 2021 --- ---Machine Hours 9618 4745 --- ---Oil Hours 0 2000 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.6 40.8 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 15 15 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 4 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 30 44 --- ---Copper ppm 0 <1 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 0 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3806 3965 --- ---Magnesium ppm 15 14 --- ---Zinc ppm 1572 1584 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1280 1295 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 141 175 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COVCHE [WUSCAR] 05910357 (Generated: 07/31/2023 16:19:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LOADER SHOP - COVCHE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150G 23510\Front Axle [VCP416444] 20 Jul 2023 @ 9618.0 hrs

